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For a tobacco tie you will need a
piece of square red cloth and a
pinch of tobacco. When grabbing
your tobacco, you will always use
your left hand. We do this as it is
the hand that connects directly
to our heart.

Take the tobacco and place it in
the centre of the cloth. Keep in
mind what you are giving this tie
for; asking for teaching or for
ceremony, it is important to hold
the purpose in your head and
heart at all times when making
your tobacco tie.

TWO

HOW TO TIE A 
TOBACCO TIE



FOUR
Taking each end of the cloth,
ensuring to keep the fold closed
and all tobacco inside, begin
tying a basic knot, careful not to
tie too tightly. 

FIVE
Your tobacco tie is now ready to
be gifted.

For more information, please visit 
www.crowshieldlodge.com

THREE
Starting from the edge, slowly fold
your cloth inwards. This will keep
the tobacco in the centre of the
cloth and make it easier for you
to tie off.


